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1. Availability: 
 

For service to any customer for off-peak seasonal gas usage. Service under this 
rate will only be provided for equipment which is primarily operated during the May 
through September seasonal period. This rate is closed to new customers on or 
after January 1, 2019. 

 
Gas delivered hereunder will be separately metered and shall not be used 
interchangeably with gas supplied under any other rate schedule. 
 

FOR MAY TO SEPTEMBER BILLING PERIODS: 
 
2. Rate Per Month: 
 
 Customer charge Residential:  $ 31.20 
 
 Customer charge Commercial/Industrial: $  80.00 
 
3. Rate per Ccf: 
 

Seasonal rate filed annually by April 1, for approval by the Public Utilities 
Regulatory Authority (the “Authority”). The rate so established shall be for the May 
through September seasonal period. 

 
4. Minimum Rate: 
 

Unless authorized by the Authority as in the public interest, the average price of 
gas sold, excluding the service charge, by the Company to any customer under 
this rate schedule shall not be less than the current cost of gas per Ccf as 
estimated by the Company plus $.005/Ccf divided by 0.95, or other factor 
reflecting the currently applicable taxes. 

 
5. Maximum Rate: 
 

The average price of gas sold, excluding the service charge, by the Company to 
any customer under this rate schedule shall not exceed for the billing period the 
rate per Ccf of the customer's applicable firm rate. 
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INCIDENTAL USAGE WHICH OCCURS DURING OCTOBER TO APRIL BILLING PERIODS: 

 
6. Rate per Month: 
  
 Customer charge Residential:      $  20.35 
 
 Customer charge Commercial/Industrial:   $ 50.00 
 
7. Rate per ccf: 
 
 Residential: 
 
  Delivery Charge  $1.7912 per Ccf 
 
  DIMP Charge:  $0.1568 per Ccf 
 
               Decoupling Charge     $0.06182474 per Ccf 

 
               SER Charge     $0.1407 per Ccf 
 

Supply Charge: Established monthly in accordance with and pursuant to the         
Purchased Gas Adjustment Clause as approved by the Authority.   

    
   Sales Services Charge  $0.0816 per Ccf 
 
 Commercial/Industrial:  
    
   Delivery Charge   
          First 100 Ccf:  $0.5967 per Ccf 
          Over 100 Ccf:  $0.1790 per Ccf 

 
 DIMP Charge:  $0.0500 per Ccf 
 

               Decoupling Charge     $0.06182474 per Ccf 
 

               SER Charge     $0.0427 per Ccf 
 

Supply Charge: Established monthly in accordance with and pursuant to the          
Purchased Gas Adjustment Clause as approved by the Authority. 
 
Sales Services Charge:  $0.0907 per Ccf  
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8. Minimum Monthly Charge: 
 
 The applicable Customer Charge. 
 
9. Payment: 
 
 Bills will be rendered monthly and are due and payable upon presentation. 
 
10. Delayed Payment Charge: 
 

Billings not fully paid within twenty-eight days of the billing date shall be subject to 
interest charges on the unpaid balance at the rate of 1.25% per month.  

 
11. Term of Service:  
 
 For an initial period of not less than one year and thereafter until terminated by 

either party on thirty (30) days written notice.  
 
New customers that qualify for a Company tariff that includes a third-party gas 
supplier option but have commenced service under this Rate SE have three (3) 
months from their initial gas flow to elect to switch to a third-party gas supplier. 
However, these new customers may not switch during the winter months of 
November through March. 

 
12. Service Regulations: 
 

The Company’s Service Rules and Regulations shall apply to service under this 
Rate SE, to the extent not inconsistent with the terms and conditions of this Rate 
SE. Bills less than 28 days or more than 34 days will be prorated. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 


